290

THE BELFAST GAZETTE FRIDAY 22 MARCH 2002

10.

11.

12.

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each addition al 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Standard Service parcel to Zone 10

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Economy Service parcel to Zone 10

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Standard Service parcel to Zone 11

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5 kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Economy Service parcel to Zone 11

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Standard Service parcel to Zone 12

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

Economy Service parcel to Zone 12

not exceeding 0.5kg in weight:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

in weight up to 2.5kg:

each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 2.5kg in weight up to and including 5kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 5kg in weight up to and including 10kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 10kg in weight up to and including 15kg:
each additional 0.5kg or part of 0.5kg

above 15kg in weight in excess of 15kg up to 20kg:

1.15

1.05

0.90

13.40

3.35

3.20

2.60

1.95

1.55

12.15

2.20

1.90

1.85

1.70

1.65

18.40

3.35

2.95

2.40

2.45

2.30

16.80

2.75

2.25

2.05

1.90

1.75

18.50

4.40

4.20

3.85

3.25

2.85

13.15

2.00

2.00

1.75

1.80

1.80”

Parcel Compensation Fee

4. InColumn | in Part 1 of Schedule 3 to the Scheme -
(a) for “£1” there shall be substituted “£1.25";
(b) for “£2’ there shall be substituted “£2.50”.

@ Consignia plc (a company registered in England and Wales under number
4138203) isauniversal service provider as defined in section 4(3)(a) of the Postal
Services Act 2000.

® 2000 c.26

© The Post Office Overseas Parcel Post Scheme 1982 was amended, renamed
the Successor Postal Services Company Overseas Parcel Post Scheme 2001 and
treated as made under section 89 of the Postal ServicesAct 2000 by article 41 of
the Postal ServicesAct 2000 (Commencement No. 4 and Transitional and Saving
Provisions) Order 2001 (2001/1148 (C.37)).

@ |_ondon Gazette 29/6/2001, issue number 56259

© London Gazette 6/7/2001, issue number 56266

O London Gazette 21/12/2001, issue number 56424

Signed by Louise Rolfe for and on behalf of Consignia plc.
6 March 2002.

Consgnia plc Scheme P1/2002

[This Note is not part of the Scheme]

Note: The Scheme which follows this Note is made under section 89 of
the Postal ServicesAct 2000 and amends the Successor Postal Services
Company Inland Parcel Post Scheme 2001. The Scheme, which comes
into force on 2nd April 2002 revises charges for private boxes.
CONSIGNIA PLC INLAND PARCEL POST (AMENDMENT

NO. 3) SCHEME 2002

Made ..o e e e e Bt Maarch 2002
Coming into operation .............c.ccceeeveevvvvnneeeeen.. 2nd April 2002
Consigniaplc® by virtue of the powers conferred upon it by section 89
of the Postal Services Act 2000® and of all other powers enabling it in
this behalf, hereby makes the following Scheme:

Commencement, citation and interpretation

1.-(1) This Scheme shall come into operation on 2nd April 2002 and
may be cited as the Consignia plc Inland Parcel Post (Amendment No.
3) Scheme 2002.

(2) ThisSchemeshall beread as one with the Successor Postal Services
Company Inland Parcel Post Scheme 2001© (hereinafter called “the
Scheme”) as amended by the Consignia plc Inland Parcel Post
(Amendment No. 1) Scheme 2001 and the Consigniaplc Inland Parcel
Post (Amendment No. 2) Scheme 2001©.

Postal Facilities

2. Inparagraph 3A(1)(a) of Schedule 3 to the Scheme (Postal facilities),
for “£70.00 per annum” there shall be substituted “£75 per annum”.

@ Consignia plc (a company registered in England and Wales under number
4138203) isauniversal service provider as defined in section 4(3)(a) of the Postal
ServicesAct 2000. Consigniaplc isthe successor postal services company referred
to in article 37(1) of the Postal Services Act 2000 (Commencement No. 4 and
Transitional and Savings Provisions) Order 2001 (2001/1148 (C.37)).

® 2000 c.26

© The Post Office Inland Parcel Post Scheme 1989 was amended, renamed the
Successor Postal Services Company Inland Parcel Post Scheme 2001 and treated
as made under section 89 of the Postal Services Act 2000 by article 38 of the
Postal Services Act 2000 (Commencement No. 4 and Transitional and Saving
Provisions) Order 2001 (2001/1148 (C.37)).

@ London Gazette 29/6/2001, issue number 56259

© London Gazette 6/7/2001, issue number 56266

Signed by Louise Rolfe for and on behalf of Consignia plc.

Dated 6 March 2002.

Tdecommunications

Notice Under Section 12(2) of The
TelecommunicationsAct 1984

PROPOSED MODIFICATION TO THE LICENCES OF
EARTHADVICE LTD, EUROCALL LTD, FIBRENET UK LTD
AND AT& T GLOBAL NETWORK SERVICES (UK) B.V.

1. The Director General of Telecommunications (the “Director”) in
accordance with section 12(2) of the Telecommunications Act 1984 as
amended by the Electronic CommunicationsAct 2000 (the “ Act”) hereby
gives notice that he proposes to make a modification to the licence
granted to Earthadvice Ltd on 29th January 2002, the licence granted




